# REPORT TO: ENVIRONMENTAL AND CONSUMER PROTECTION COMMITTEE 19<sup>TH</sup> FEBRUARY 2001

**REPORT ON: PURCHASE OF WHEELED BINS** 

### REPORT BY: DIRECTOR OF ENVIRONMENTAL AND CONSUMER PROTECTION

**REPORT NO: 102-2001** 

#### 1.0 PURPOSE OF REPORT

1.1 To accept prices for the purchase of wheeled bins for a one-year period.

#### 2.0 RECOMMENDATIONS

- 2.1 The offer from SSI Schaeffer for the supply of grey domestic bins (all sizes) and blue paper bins (all sizes) be accepted.
- 2.2 The offer from OTTO for the supply of brown compost bins (all sizes) be accepted.
- 2.3 The offer from Egbert Taylor for the supply of Euro bins (all sizes) be accepted. This is the current supplier and have a proven reliability record.

#### 3.0 FINANCIAL IMPLICATIONS

- 3.1 £7000 of wheeled bins will be purchased from the Environmental and Consumer Protection Department's Capital Budget for 2000/1.
- 3.2 Provision has been made in the Environmental and Consumer Protection Department's 2001/2 Revenue and Capital Budgets for the purchase of bins and further reports will be submitted to the Committee as required.
- 3.3 Expenditure of £40530 will also be incurred on the purchase of bins to be funded from the Scottish Executive's Strategic Waste Fund.

#### 4.0 DUNDEE 21 IMPLICATIONS

4.1 Resources are used efficiently and waste is minimised.

## 5.0 EQUAL OPPORTUNITIES IMPLICATIONS

5.1 Nil

#### 6.0 BACKGROUND

- 6.1 In this financial year, the £7000 balance of the Capital Budget will be spent on the purchase of grey domestic bins for replacement purposes.
- 6.2 The 2001/2 Capital and Revenue budgets will be used to purchase new and replacement bins for domestic and trade purposes.

6.3 Reference is made to Article V of the Environmental and Consumer Protection Committee of 15 January 2001 when acceptance was given for the purchase of Euro bins and additional compostainers as part of the Scottish Executive's Strategic Waste Fund for composting and recycling initiatives.

## 7.0 CONSULTATION

Chief Executive Director of Support Services Director of Finance

# 8.0 BACKGROUND PAPERS

8.1 Summary of Tenders

## 9.0 SIGNATURE

Director	of	Environmental	and	Consumer	Date:	2 <sup>nd</sup>	February
Protectior	ו				2001		

# COST

all amount shown are pounds sterling and exclude VAT

TENDERER Egbert Taylor Egbert Taylor	DOMESTIC GREY BINS			BLUE PAPER BINS			BROWN COMPOSTAINER BINS			1100Ltr EURO BIN280 Ltr EURO BINS		
	140 Ltr	240 Ltr	360 L tr	140 Ltr	240 Ltr	360 Ltr	140 Ltr	240 Ltr	360 Ltr	with slats		
	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no Eid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	1994501id	185 00	201.54bin lid 199.00 99.5 slats or holes 216.00
Contenur	11.35	14.90	26.50	11.35	14.90	26.50	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Plastic Omnium	11.13	11.91	31.87	11.13	11.91	31.87	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Titan Plastics MGM	12.83	13.25	35.25	12.83	14.78	35.74	no bid	no bid	no bid	216.23	216.23	no bid
SSI Schaefer	11.00	12.00	24.00	11.00	12.00	24.00	19.00	22.00	no bid	248.00	248.00	no bid
οττο	12.80	13.00	36.00	12.80	13.00	36.00	15.65	19.55	no bid	198.00	198.00	no bid

#### QUALITY OF PLASTIC USED

in Kgs

TENDERER	DOMESTIC GREY BINS			BLUF PAPER BINS			BROWN COMPOSTAINER BINS			1100Ltr EURO BIN280 Ltr EURO BINS		
	140 Ltr	240 Ltr	360 Ltr	140 Ltr	240 Ltr	360 Ltr	140 Ltr	240 Ltr	360 Ltr	with slats with holes		
Egbert Taylor Egbert Taylor										plain lid 185.00	slats or holes 216.00	
Contenur	virgin HDPF	virgin HDPE	virgin HDPE	virgin HDPE	virgn HDPE	virgin HDPE						
Plastic Omnium	10.4	13.5	16.6	10.4	13.5	16.6						
Titan Plastics MGM	11.0	10.7	19.7	11.0	10.7	197						
SSI Schaefer	8.8	12.05	21.8	8.3	12.05	218	10.3	16.3				
отто	7.3	10.60	17.4	7.3	10.60	17.4	7.9	11.2				